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!:!EMM&.I (,:r Mr. Giriraj Sharma <gsharma@inmiit.ac.in>

tnformation Tectnology

Vikas Sharma <s.vikasiiti@gmail.com>

Thu, Apr 27, 2023 at 9:59 AM
To: "Mr. Giriraj Sharma" <gsharma@Inmiit.ac.in>

Forwarded message
From: <SERB_Administrator@serbonline.in>
Date: Tue, Mar 14, 2023 at 11:41 AM
Subject: Sanction Order : TAR/2022/000481
To: <info@serbonline.in>

Science and Engineering Research Board
(Statutory Body Established Through an Act of Parliament : SERB Act 2008)
Department of Science and Technology, Government of India

. Dear Dr. Vikas Sharma,

. The below details for Science & Engineering Research Board (SERB) Sanction Order (attached to this mail)

Sanction Order No  TAR/2022/000481
| Sanction Date 24 November, 2022
. PIName Dr. Vikas Sharma
. Institute/University  The LNM Institute Of Information Technology , Rupa Ki Nangal, Post-sumel, Via-jamdoti, Jaipur, Jaipur, Rajasthan-302031
. Account Number 61086329418
© Bank & Branch Name STATE BANK OF INDIA SECRETARIAT, JAIPUR 302005

. Amount INR 275000/~
- In Rupees Two Lakh Seventy Five Thousand
UTR No RBI0702349067031

. Transaction Date 10 March, 2023

SERB Reference Number:

Bill No
Diary No / Finance No SERB/F/7175/2022-2023

Sanction Order No  TAR/2022/000481

Sanction Date 24 November, 2022

Pl Name Dr. Vikas Sharma

Institute/University  The LNM Institute Of Information Technology , Rupa Ki Nangal, Post-sumel, Via-jamdoli, Jaipur, Jaipur, Rajasthan-302031
Account Number 38368990543

Bank & Branch Name STATE BANK OF INDIA IIT KANPUR, IIT KANPUR-208016

Amount INR 335000/~
In Rupees Three Lakh Thirty Five Thousand
UTR No RBI0702349067173

| Transaction Date 10 March, 2023

SERB Reference Number:

Bill No
Diary No / Finance No SERB/F/7175/2022-2023

Confirmation of receipt of funds may be sent by email only.

IMPORTANT:

1. SEPARATE Utilization Certificates (UCs) for Recurring and Non Recurring (even if DISBURSED BY SERB THROUGH ONE SANCTION ORDER for your project) should be sent directly to the
grant Sanctioning Authority by name (signatory of the sanction order ) within twelve hs of the cl of the fi ial year in which the grants were released irrespecrive of whether the
subsequent instalment of grant is due for release or not.

2. However, if any unspent balance is to be refunded, kindly ensure that the unutilized amount may be refunded immediately by way of an a/c payee cheque/DD drawn in favour of "Fund for Science &
Engineering Research”, payable at New Delhi and forwarded to the undersigned at the address given below:

qﬁ / for

3@ |G Under Secretary

o wd el srpRiarr oY (Tagamml)

Science & Engineering Research Board (SERB)

(e SR e faum, YR TReR &1 U wifafus Fem)

(A statutory body of Department of Science and Technology, Govt. of India)
AT SR At 7, -, SETen e




Third & Fourth Floor, Block-Il, Technology Bhawan
T Aeet A3, 7€ Rt - 110016

New Mehrauli Road, New Delhi - 110016

U / CONTACT:

011-26552111(General Enquiries),

011-26552102 (TSA Enquiries)

011-26552103 (UTR Enquiries)

011-26552104 (UC/SE Enquiries)

011-26552107 (Refunds/Interest Enquiries)

011-26552100 2RI / Telefax: 011-26511094

srseansansasansrrsaneins | EGAL DISCLAIMER ****+4sassasassussusaeass

Piease do not reply to this mail I!

[ SERB is now on Social-Media. Kindly follow us on Twitter: @serbonline https://www.twitter.com/serbonline]

This is a system generated information and does not require any signature.This E-Mail may contain Confidential and/or legally privileged Information and is meant for the intendedrecipient(s) only. If you have
received this e-mail in error and are not the intended recipient/s, kindly notify us at info@serbonline.in and then delete this e-mail irr iately from your system. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure,
dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this email or any action taken in reliance on this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be
timely,secure, error or virus-free. The sender does not accept any liability for any errors, omissions, viruses or computer problems experienced by any recipient as a result of this e-mail.

'SAVE PAPER - THINK BEFORE YOU PRINT!

* Doniy Y4t want to receive such notification anymore?Click here to send a mail to unsubscribe

f’} Sanction order for TAR/2022/000481.pdf
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File No. TAR/2022/000481

The updated RTGS details of the The LNM Institute of Information Technology , Rupa ki nangal, post-sumel,

via-jamdoli, jaipur, Jaipur, Rajasthan-302031 is as below:

| PFMS Unique Code [[LNMIT |~

| AccountName |[LNMIIT RESEARCH FUND

|Account Number 61086329418

Bank Name & Branch || STATE BANK OF INDIA SECRETARIAT, JAIPUR 302005

IFSC/RTGS Code _ |[SBIN0031031 _~

Email id of A/C Holder|FINANCE@IAMIIT.AC.IN

[ PFMS Unique Code |ITKANPUR

[ AccountName |[REGISTRAR, HT KANPUR

|Account Number 138368990543°

L]

[Bank Name & Branch || STATE BANK OF INDIA IIT KANPUR, [IT KANPUR-208016

IFSC/RTGS Code __|[SBIN0001161,

[Email id of A/C Holder|[SDR_DORD@IITK.AC.IN

|
1
|

(V
r.Shilpi Paul
Scientist F




FILE NO. TAR/2022/000481
SCIENCE & ENGINEERING RESEARCH BOARD(SERB)
(A statutory body of the Department of Science & Technology, government of India)
Science and Engineering Research Board

3rd & 4th Floor, Block II
Technology Bhavan, New Mehrauli Road
New Delhi - 110016

Dated: 24-Nov-2022
ORDER
Subject: Financial Sanction under Teachers Associateship for Research Excellence (TARE) to Dr. Vikas
Sharma, The LNM Institute Of Information Technology , Rupa Ki Nangal, Post-sumel, Via-jamdoli,
Jaipur, Jaipur, Rajasthan-302031- under the mentorship of Dr. Bishakh Bhattacharya, at Indian Institute
of Technology Kanpur Kanpur IIT, PO Kanpur - 208016- Release of 1st grant.

Sanction of Science and Engineering Research Board (SERB) is hereby accorded to the above mentioned grant at
a total cost of Rs. 18,30,000/- (Rs. Rupees Eighteen Lakh Thirty Thousand only Only) for a duration of 36 months.

The date of start of the project will be 31 October, 2022 .The items of expenditure for which the total

allocation of Rs. 18,30,000/- has been approved are given below:

The following budget is proposed for

The LNM Institute Of Information Technology , Rupa Ki Nangal, Post-sumel, Via-
jamdoli, Jaipur, Jaipur, Rajasthan-302031 (Parent)

Sl. No. Budget Head Amount

1 Fellowship Rs. 0 ( @0/- per month (consolidated))
2. Research Grant Rs. 2,50,000/- per annum

3. Overheads Rs. 25,000/- per annum

Indian Institute of Technology Kanpur Kanpur IIT, PO Kanpur - 208016 (Host)

SL Budget Head |Amount

No.

S Fellowship Rs. 60,000 ( on completion of 90 days mandatory attendance in the host institute every
year)

2. Research Rs. 2,50,000/- per annum

Grant
3 Overheads Rs. 25,000/- per annum

 al
2. Sanction of the SERB is also accorded to the payment of Rs. 2,75,000/- (Rupees Two Lakh Seventy Five
Thousand only) to The LNM Institute Of Information Technology, Rupa Ki Nangal, Post-Sumel, Via-Jamdoli,
Jaipur, Rs. 3,35 000/~ ‘(Rupees Three Lakh Thirty Five Thousand only) to Indian Institute of Technology Kanpur
““Kanpur IIT, PO Kanpur - 208016 being the first installment of the grant it for the year 2022-2023 for

implementation of the said research project.

3. The expenditure involved is debitable to

Fund for Science & Engineering Research (FSER)
This release is being made under Teachers Associateship For Research Excellence (TARE). (Mechanical &
Manufacturing Engineering & Robotics)

4. The Sanction has been issued to with the approval of the competent authority vide Diary No.
SERB/F/7175/2022-2023 dated 23 November, 2022

s ~

5. Sanction of the grant is subject to the conditions as detailed in Terms & Conditions available at website
(www.serb.gov.in).

6. Overhead expenses are meant for the host Institute towards the cost for providing infrastructural facilities
and general administrative support etc. including benefits to the staff employed in the project.

7. As per rule 211 of GFR, the accounts of project shall be open to inspection by sanctioning authority/audit
whenever the institute is called upon to do so.



8. The release amount of Rs. 2,75,003?«4;)%3 Two Lakh Seventy Five Thousand only) will be drawn by the ° '

Under Secretary of the SERB and will be disbursed by means of RTGS transaction as per their Bank details given
below: v

The LNM Institute of Information Technology , Rupa ki nangal, post-sumel, via-jamdoli, jaipur, Jaipur,
Rajasthan-302031 (Parent) :

PFMS Unique Code RJKA00000130

Account Name LNMIIT RESEARCH FUND

Account Number 369202010079134

Bank Name & Branch UNION BANK OF INDIA BAPU NAGAR BRANCH, SB-57, RIDDHI TOWER, TONK
ROAD, JAIPUR-302015

IFSC/RTGS Code UBIN0536920

Email address of PI s.vikasiiti@gmail.com

Email id of A/C Holder FINANCE@LNMIIT.AC.IN

Email address of tare.serbindia@gmail.com

concerned officer 7

The release amount of Rs. 3,35,04—(Rupees Three Lakh Thirty Five Thousand only) will be drawn by the Under
Secretary of the SERB and will be disbursed by means of RTGS transaction as per their Bank details given below:

Indian Institute of Technology Kanpur Kanpur IIT, PO Kanpur - 208016 (Host) :

PFMS Unique Code IITKANPUR

Account Name REGISTRAR, IIT KANPUR

Account Number 38368990543

Bank Name & Branch STATE BANK OF INDIA IIT KANPUR, IIT KANPUR-208016
IFSC/RTGS Code SBIN00O01161

Email address of PI s.vikasiiti@gmail.com

Email id of A/C Holder SDR_DORDEIITK.AC.IN

Email id of Mentor Dr. Bishakh Bhattacharya

9.Both the institutes will furnish Utilization certificate(UCs) financial year wise to the SERB and an audited
statement of accounts pertaining to the grant immediately after the end of each financial year.

10. The institute will maintain separate audited accounts for the fellowship. A part or whole of the grant must be
kept in an interest earning bank account which is to be reported to SERB. The interest thus earned will be
treated as credit to the institute to be adjusted towards further instaliment of the grant.

11. The File no. TAR/2022/000481 may also be mentioned in all research communications arising from the above
project with due acknowledgement of SERB.

12. As this is the first grant for the fellowship, no previous U/C is required.

13. The institute may refund any unspent balance to SERB by means of a Demand Draft favoring "FUND FOR
SCIENCE AND ENGINEERING RESEARCH" payable at New Delhi.

14. The organization/institute/university should ensure that the technical support/financial assistance provided
to them by the Science & Engineering Research Board, a statutory body of the Department of Science &
Technology (DST), Government of India should invariably be highlighted/ acknowledged in their media releases
as well as in bold letters in the opening paragraphs of their Annual Report.

15. In addition, the investigator/host institute must also acknowledge the support provided to ther in all
publications, patents and any other output emanating out of the project/program funded by the Scidnce &

Engineering Research Board, a statutory body of Department of Science & Technology (DST), Gevernment of
India.

(Dr. Arvind Chaudhary)
Scientist D
tare.serbindia@gmail.com




To,

Under Secretary
* SERB, New Delhi
Copy forwarded for information and necessary action to; -

The Principal Director of Audit, A.G.C.R.Building, Illrd Floor LP. Estate, Delhi-110002

N

Sanction Folder, SERB, New Delhi.,

@

File Copy

Lol

(i) Dr. Vikas Sharma
Mechanical Mechatronics Engineering

The LNM Institute of Information Technology , Rupa ki nangal, post-sumel, via-jamdoli, jaipur,
Jaipur, Rajasthan-302031

Email: s.vikasiiti@gmail.com
Mobile: 919039348751

(i) Dr. Bishakh Bhattacharya
Indian Institute of Technology Kanpur Kanpur IIT, PO Kanpur - 208016

(Start date of the project may be intimated by name to the undersigned. For
guidance, terms & Conditions etc. Please visit www.serb.gov.in.)

(i) DIRECTOR,
The LNM Institute Of Information Technology, Rupa Ki Nangal, Post-Sumel, Via-Jamdoli, Jaipur

(ii))REGISTRAR
Indian Institute of Technology Kanpur Kanpur IIT, PO Kanpur - 208016

(Receipt of Grant may be intimated by name to the undersigned) |

A (A"
NN
(Dr. Axvind Chaudhary)
Scientist D

tare.serbindia@gmail.com
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The LNM Institute of Information Technology, Jaipur

(Deemed-to-be-University)

Certificate of Appreciation

This certificate of appreciation is being awarded to
Pr. Oikas Sharma

on the 21st Foundation Day of the Institute on September 14, 2023,

in recognition of his Outstanding performance.

REGISTRAR

.4 -
WA st e,

-

i
DIRECTOR




